Title: Street Sweeping Disposal Services

Opening Date: Wednesday, February 3, 2016 - 2:00pm

Contract #: CC-0067-16

BID TABULATION SHEET

Sighed Stock Non- Atfirm
Total Bids Received: 2 Proposal | Disclose | Collusion | Action NJ BRC IRAN Co-op CcD Excep. Notes
Waste Management of NJ, Inc.
107 Silvia Street X X X 1203 X X Y Y N
Ewing, NJ 08628
DCRS LLC.
PO Box 328 X X X 28719 X X Y Y N

Cream Ridge, NJ 08514




Street Sweeping Disposal Services

Waste Management of NJ

Deer Carcass Removal Services LLC

CC-0067-16
Per Ton- Unit Price | Per Ton- Unit Price | Per Ton- Unit Price | Per Ton- Unit Price | Per Ton- Unit Price | Per Ton- Unit Price
Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3
Scheduled Items of Work
Loading, transportation & recycling/disposal reuse of ID-27 No Bid No Bid No Bid
materials (Dry Industrial) o bl obl 0Bl $ 39.50| $ 3950 | $ 41.50
Loading, transportation & recycling/reuse of ID-10 or ID-13 No Bid No Bid No Bid
: P o Bi o Bi 0 Bi
materials (Household Municipal Waste) $ 70.00| $ 7000 | $ 71.50
Loading, transportation & recycling/reuse of 1ID-13 materials . . .
(Bulky Waste) No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 70.00| $ 70.00 | $ 71.50
Option A (without loading)
Transportation & recycling/disposal reuse of ID-27 materials . . .
(Dry Industrial) No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 36.50| $ 3650 | $ 37,50
Transportation & recycling/reuse of ID-10 or ID-13 materials No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Household Municipal Waste) 0Bl 0Bl 0Bl $ 45.00| $ 45.00 | $ 46.00
Loading, transportation & recycling/reuse of ID-13 materials i i .
(Bulky Waste) No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 45,00 $ 4500 | $ 46.00
Option B (acceptance of delivery of 30 cy or similar container at
contractor designated site.)
ID-27 materials (Dry Industrial ; ; ;
(Dry ) No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 35.00| $ 35.00 | $ 36.00
ID-10 or ID-13 materials (Household Municipal Waste) . . .
No Bid No Bid No Bid
$ 80.00( $ 8240 | $ 84.87
ID-13 materials (Bulky Waste ; ; ;
(Bulky Waste) $ 80.00| $ 8240 | 84.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Contract period: 1 Year with right to extend for 2 additional 1 year service periods
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