Title: Vehicle Parts and Repairs - Original Equipment Manufactured (OEM)
Opening Date: Wednesday, March 9, 2016 - 3:00pm

Contract #: CC-0012-16

BID TABULATION SHEET

Signed Stock Non- Atfirm
Total Bids Received: Proposal | Disclose | Collusion | Action NJ BRC IRAN Co-op CD Excep. Exceptions
. Parts Pricing Exception:
Malouf Ford Lincoln Parts at 40% list to dealer =
2210 US Hwy 1 X X X 9924 X X Y Y Y 37% off list
North Brunswick, NJ 08902 Parts less than 40% list to dealer = 25% off
list
Nielson Dodge
175 Route 10 X X X X X Y Y Y N
East Hanover, NJ 07936
Engine Land, Inc.
155 Division Street X X X X X X Y Y N
Elizabeth, NJ 07201
Ditschman Flemington Ford Items with list to dealer less than 40% will be
priced at list - 22%
215 Route 31/202 X X X 6512 X X Y Y Y Ford Parts discount based on Motorcraft parts.
Flemington, NJ 08822 Ford only parts will be sold at list - 37.5%
Ford Engines & Transmissions Priced at (Dealer
Fred Beans Parts Cost-Minus $1.00)
131 Doyle Street X X X 46579 X X Y Y Y* General Motors, Dodge/Jeep, and Toyota

Doylestown, PA 18901

Engines & Transmissions priced at (Dealer cost +
plus $50.00)




Contract#: CC-0012-16

Vehicle Parts & Repairs - Original Equipment Manufactured (OEM),

Parts and Repairs Price Sheet

Ford Parts and Repairs

Chevrolet Parts and Repairs

Buick Parts and Repairs

Pontiac Parts and Repairs

Dodge Parts and Repairs

Jeep Parts and Repairs

Toyota Parts and Repairs

GMC Parts and Repairs

Vendor Price Per Hour [% Off List Price |Price Per Hour |% Off List Price |Price Per Hour |% Off List Price |Price Per Hour |% Off List Price |Price Per Hour |% Off List Price |Price Per Hour [% Off List Price |Price Per Hour |% Off List Price |Price Per Hour |% Off List Price
Cars Labor Rate Malouf Ford Lincoln $ 65.00 37
Cars Labor Rate Nielson Dodge $ 100.00 $ 100.00
Cars Labor Rate Engine Land | ¢ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00
Cars Labor Rate Ditschman Ford | g 89.00 $ 89.00 $ 89.00 $ 89.00 $ 89.00 $ 89.00 NO BID $ 89.00

Cars Labor Rate

Trucks up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine-

Fred Bean

Malouf Ford Lincoln

Vans up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine-

Malouf Ford Lincoln

Labor Rate $ 70.00 37
Trucks up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine- Nielson Dodge
Labor Rate $ 120.00 $ 100.00
Trucks up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine- Engine Land
Labor Rate $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00
Trucks up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine- Ditschman Ford
Labor Rate $ 89.00 $ 89.00 $ 89.00 $ 89.00 $ 89.00 $ 89.00 NO BID $ 89.00
Trucks up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine-
Fred Bean
Labor Rate
e _________________________________ ________________ __________ __________ _________ ___________ _________ _________|
Trucks up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine- .
Labor Rate Malouf Ford Lincoln $ 75.00 37
Trucks up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine- Nielson Dodge
Labor Rate 9 $ 120.00 $ 100.00
Trucks up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine- Engine Land
Labor Rate 9 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00
Trucks up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine- Ditschman Ford
Labor Rate $ 99.00 $ 99.00 $ 99.00 $ 99.00 $ 99.00 $ 99.00 NO BID $ 99.00
Trucks up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine-
Fred Bean
Labor Rate

Labor Rate $ 70.00 37
Vans up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine- Nielson Dodge
Labor Rate $ 100.00 $ 100.00
Vans up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine- Engine Land
Labor Rate $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00
Vans up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine- Ditschman Ford
Labor Rate $ 89.00 $ 89.00 $ 89.00 $ 89.00 $ 89.00 $ 89.00 NO BID $ 89.00
Vans up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine-
Fred Bean
Labor Rate
e ___ ____ ___ ___ ______________________________ ______________ ______________ _________ __________ ____________ ___________ ________ _________|
Vans up to 14,E§So?¥geDlesel Engine- Malouf Ford Lincoln s 500 a7
Vans up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine- Nielson Dodge
Labor Rate $ 100.00 $ 100.00
Vans up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine- Engine Land
Labor Rate $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00
Vans up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine- Ditschman Ford
Labor Rate $ 99.00 $ 99.00 $ 99.00 $ 99.00 $ 99.00 $ 99.00 NO BID $ 99.00
Vans up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine-
Fred Bean
Labor Rate

Buses up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine- .

Labor Rate Malouf Ford Lincoln $ 80.00 37
Buses up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine- Nielson Dodge

Labor Rate $ 100.00 $ 100.00
Buses up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine- Engine Land

Labor Rate $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00
Buses up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine- Ditschman Ford

Labor Rate $ 105.00 $ 105.00 $ 105.00 $ 105.00 $ 105.00 $ 105.00 NO BID $ 105.00
Buses up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine-

Fred Bean
Labor Rate
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Contract#: CC-0012-16

Vehicle Parts & Repairs - Original Equipment Manufactured (OEM),

Parts and Repairs Price Sheet

Ford Parts and Repairs

Chevrolet Parts and Repairs

Buick Parts and Repairs

Pontiac Parts and Repairs

Dodge Parts and Repairs

Jeep Parts and Repairs

Toyota Parts and Repairs

GMC Parts and Repairs

Vendor Price Per Hour [% Off List Price |Price Per Hour |% Off List Price |Price Per Hour |% Off List Price |Price Per Hour |% Off List Price |Price Per Hour |% Off List Price |Price Per Hour [% Off List Price |Price Per Hour |% Off List Price |Price Per Hour |% Off List Price
Buses up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine- Malouf Ford Lincoln
Labor Rate $ 80.00 37
Buses up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine- Nielson Dodge
Labor Rate $ 100.00 $ 100.00
Buses up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine- Engine Land
Labor Rate $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00
Buses up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine- Ditschman Ford
Labor Rate $ 105.00 $ 105.00 $ 105.00 $ 105.00 $ 105.00 $ 105.00 NO BID $ 105.00
Buses up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine-
Fred Bean
Labor Rate

Hybrid Labor Rate

Malouf Ford Lincoln

$ 80.00 37
Hybrid Labor Rate Nielson Dodge $ 100.00 $ 100.00
Hybrid Labor Rate Engineland | ¢ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00
Hybrid Labor Rate Ditschman Ford | 105.00 $ 105.00 $ 105.00 $ 105.00 $ 105.00 $ 105.00 NO BID 3 105.00

Hybrid Labor Rate

Diagnostic Time-No Repairs

Fred Bean

Malouf Ford Lincoln

$ 60.00 37
Diagnostic Time-No Repairs Nielson Dodge $ 100.00 $ 100.00
Diagnostic Time-No Repairs Engineland | ¢ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00 $ 48.00
Diagnostic Time-No Repairs Ditschman Ford | 85.00 $ 85.00 $ 85.00 $ 85.00 $ 85.00 $ 85.00 NO BID $ 85.00

Diagnostic Time-No Repairs

Percentage of discount for OEM parts when
used in the repair of vehicles

Fred Bean

Malouf Ford Lincoln

37

Percentage of discount for OEM parts when

Nielson Dodge

used in the repair of vehicles 32 32
Percentage of discount for OEM parts when
. . . Engine Land
used in the repair of vehicles 20 20 20 20 20 20 20 20
Percentage of discount for OEM parts when Ditschman Ford
used in the repair of vehicles 49.5 355 355 355 355 355 NO BID 355

Percentage of discount for OEM parts when
used in the repair of vehicles

Percentage of discount for OEM parts when
picked up / No Repairs (Over the Counter’

Fred Bean

Malouf Ford Lincoln

38

Percentage of discount for OEM parts when
picked up / No Repairs (Over the Counter’

Nielson Dodge

Percentage of discount for OEM parts when
picked up / No Repairs (Over the Counter’

Percentage of discount for OEM parts when
picked up / No Repairs (Over the Counter’

Percentage of discount for OEM parts when
picked up / No Repairs (Over the Counter’

32 32
Engine Land 20 20 20 20 20 20 20 20
Ditschman Ford 495 355 355 355 355 355 NO BID 35.5
Fred Bean 40.4 35.8 35.8 35.8 35.6 35.6 316 35.8
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