
Signed 
Proposal 

Stock 
Disclose

Non-
Collusion

Affirm 
Action NJ BRC IRAN CD Excep. Coop

Y

Total Bids Received: 

x x x 5225
Chemung Supply Corp
Route 14 Miracle Mile
Elmira, NY 14903-1094

x N

BID TABULATION SHEET
Title:  Guide Rail & Guide Rail Parts
Opening Date:   Thursday, January 5, 2017  @  2:00 pm
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VENDOR NAME>> Chemung Supply

ITEM DESCRIPTION  UNIT COST 

1
Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 6’3” post hole 
spacing

 $                                  56.00 

2
Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 3’1-1/2” post 
hole spacing

 $                                  56.00 

3

Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 6’3” post hole 
spacing and additional holes for 
anchor plate

 $                                  63.00 

 

4
Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 6’3” post hole 
spacing – 10’ radius concave

 $                                135.00 

5
Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 3’1-1/2” post 
hole spacing– 10’ radius concave

 $                                135.00 

6

Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 6’3” post hole 
spacing and additional holes for 
anchor plate– 10’ radius concave

 $                                153.00 

7
Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 6’3” post hole 
spacing – 10’ radius convex

 $                                120.00 

8
Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 3’1-1/2” post 
hole spacing– 10’ radius convex

 $                                120.00 

9

Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 6’3” post hole 
spacing and additional holes for 
anchor plate– 10’ radius convex

 $                                136.00 

10
Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 6’3” post hole 
spacing – 15’ radius concave

 $                                135.00 

11
Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 3’1-1/2” post 
hole spacing– 15’ radius concave

 $                                135.00 

Guide Rail and Guide Rail Parts
 Open - Ended Contract #CC-0039-17 - Spreadsheet



12

Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 6’3” post hole 
spacing and additional holes for 
anchor plate– 15’ radius concave

 $                                153.00 

13
Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 6’3” post hole 
spacing – 15’ radius convex

 $                                106.00 

14
Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 3’1-1/2” post 
hole spacing– 15’ radius convex

 $                                106.00 

15

Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 6’3” post hole 
spacing and additional holes for 
anchor plate– 15’ radius convex

 $                                121.00 

16
Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 6’3” post hole 
spacing – 20’ radius concave

 $                                100.00 

 17
Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 3’1-1/2” post 
hole spacing– 20’ radius concave

 $                                100.00 

  18

Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 6’3” post hole 
spacing and additional holes for 
anchor plate– 20’ radius concave

 $                                115.00 

19
Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 6’3” post hole 
spacing – 20’ radius convex

 $                                  97.00 

20
Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 3’1-1/2” post 
hole spacing– 20’ radius convex

 $                                  97.00 

 21

Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5 feet long with 6’3” post hole 
spacing and additional holes for 
anchor plate– 20’ radius convex

 $                                111.00 

 22
Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 6’3” 
post hole spacing

 $                                  57.00 

23
Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 3’1-
1/2” post hole spacing

 $                                  58.00 



24

Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 6’3” 
post hole spacing and additional 
holes for anchor plate

 $                                  69.00 

25

Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 6’3” 
post hole spacing – 10’ radius 
concave

 $                                150.00 

26

Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 3’1-
1/2” post hole spacing– 10’ radius 
concave

 $                                150.00 

27

Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 6’3” 
post hole spacing and additional 
holes for anchor plate– 10’ radius 
concave

 $                                168.00 

 28

Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 6’3” 
post hole spacing – 10’ radius 
convex

 $                                134.00 

 29

Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 3’1-
1/2” post hole spacing– 10’ radius 
convex

 $                                134.00 

  30

Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 6’3” 
post hole spacing and additional 
holes for anchor plate– 10’ radius 
convex

 $                                151.00 

 31

Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 6’3” 
post hole spacing – 15’ radius 
concave

 $                                150.00 

 32

Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 3’1-
1/2” post hole spacing– 15’ radius 
concave

 $                                150.00 

 33

Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 6’3” 
post hole spacing and additional 
holes for anchor plate– 15’ radius 
concave

 $                                168.00 



 34

Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 6’3” 
post hole spacing – 15’ radius 
convex

 $                                118.00 

 35

Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 3’1-
1/2” post hole spacing– 15’ radius 
convex

 $                                118.00 

 36

Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 6’3” 
post hole spacing and additional 
holes for anchor plate– 15’ radius 
convex

 $                                134.00 

 37

Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 6’3” 
post hole spacing – 20’ radius 
concave

 $                                112.00 

 38

Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 3’1-
1/2” post hole spacing– 20’ radius 
concave

 $                                112.00 

 39

Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 6’3” 
post hole spacing and additional 
holes for anchor plate– 20’ radius 
concave

 $                                127.00 

40

Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 6’3” 
post hole spacing – 20’ radius 
convex

 $                                108.00 

 41

Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 3’1-
1/2” post hole spacing– 20’ radius 
convex

 $                                108.00 

 42

Weathering Steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5 feet long with 6’3” 
post hole spacing and additional 
holes for anchor plate– 20’ radius 
convex

 $                                123.00 

43
Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5’ long with 6’3” post hole 
spacing – 40’ Radius  (convex)

 $                                  82.00 



44
Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5’ long- with 3’ 1.5” post hole 
spacing – 40’ Radius ( convex)

 $                                  82.00 

45

Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5’ long with 6’ 3” post hole 
spacing with additional holes for 
anchor plate – 40’ Radius (convex)

 $                                100.00 

46
Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5’ long with 6’3” post hole 
spacing – 40’ Radius  (concave)

 $                                100.00 

47
Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5’ long- with 3’ 1.5” post hole 
spacing – 40’ Radius ( concave)

 $                                100.00 

48

Galvanized Guide Rail Element 
12.5’ long with 6’ 3” post hole 
spacing with additional holes for 
anchor plate – 40’ Radius (concave)

 $                                115.00 

49
Weathering steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5’ long with 6’3” post 
hole spacing – 40’ Radius  (convex)

 $                                111.00 

50

Weathering steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5’ long- with 3’ 1.5” 
post hole spacing – 40’ Radius 
(convex)

 $                                111.00 

51

Weathering steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5’ long with 6’ 3” post 
hole spacing with additional holes 
for anchor plate – 40’ Radius 
(convex)

 $                                128.00 

52

Weathering steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5’ long with 6’3” post 
hole spacing – 40’ Radius  
(concave)

 $                                111.00 

53

Weathering steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5’ long- with 3’ 1.5” 
post hole spacing – 40’ Radius 
(concave)

 $                                111.00 



54

Weathering steel Guide Rail 
Element 12.5’ long with 6’ 3” post 
hole spacing with additional holes 
for anchor plate – 40’ Radius 
(concave)

 $                                128.00 

 55
Brake Master 350 Energy 
Absorption System

 NO BID 

56 
X-Lite Tangent Lindsay 
Transportation Solution

 NO BID 

57 Fleat 350 Road Systems Inc.  NO BID 
58 SKT-SP Road Systems Inc.  NO BID 
59 Fleat SP-Road System Inc.  NO BID 
60 Fleat MT Road Systems Inc.  NO BID 

61 CAT-350 Trinity Highway Products  $                             3,250.00 

 62
Galvanized BCT Buffer with 
welded diaphragm

 $                                126.00 

 63
Weathering Steel BCT Buffer with 
welded diaphragm

 $                                156.00 

 64
Galvanized End Section Rounded 
with a 6-5/16” Radius

 $                                  49.00 

 65
Weathering Steel End Section 
Rounded with a 6-5/16” Radius

 $                                  49.00 

 66
Galvanized Terminal Connector 
Parapet

 $                                  25.00 

 67
Weathering Steel Terminal 
Connector Parapet

 $                                  53.00 

 68
Galvanized Terminal Connector for 
Buffer End

 $                                  26.00 

 69
Weathering Steel Terminal 
Connector for Buffer End

 $                                  30.00 

 70

Galvanized Post W6 x 8.5 – 72” 
Long with ¾” diameter hole drilled 
1-1/8” off center and 7” down from 
the top

 $                                  31.50 

 71

Galvanized Post W6 x 8.5 – 90” 
Long with ¾” diameter hole drilled 
1-1/8” off center and 7” down from 
the top

 $                                  39.00 



 72

Weathering Steel Post W6 x 8.5 – 
72” Long and galvanized 42” from 
the bottom up with ¾” diameter 
hole drilled 1-1/8” off center and 7” 
down from the top

 $                                  43.00 

 73

Weathering Steel Post W6 x 8.5 – 
90” Long and galvanized 60” from 
the bottom up with ¾” diameter 
hole drilled 1-1/8” off center and 7” 
down from the top

 $                                  51.00 

 74
Treated Wood Post 6” x 8” x 5’3” 
long – drilled for cable and 5/8” post 
bolt

 $                                  36.00 

 75
Treated Wood Block 6” x 8” x 14” 
long – drilled for 5/8” post bolt

 $                                    7.00 

 76
Notched Treated Wood Block 6” x 
8” x 14” long – drilled for 5/8” post 
bolt

 $                                  10.00 

 77
Notched Composite Block 6” x 8” x 
14” long – drilled for 5/8” post bolt

 $                                    5.00 

 78
Galvanized back-up plate 12” x 12” 
– drilled for threaded cable

 $                                  34.00 

 79
Galvanized Anchor plate for BCT 
end treatment

 $                                  24.00 

 80
Standard Galvanized Pipe 2” x 6” 
long

 $                                    7.00 

 81
Galvanized ¾” BCT cable assembly 
with 1” diameter threaded rod on 
both ends 

 $                                  79.00 

 82
Splice Bolt 5/8” x 1-1/4” – 
Galvanized Full Thread – Per 100 
pieces

 $                                  40.00 

 83
Splice Bolt 5/8” x 2” – Galvanized 
Full Thread – Per 100 pieces

 $                                  50.00 

 84
Splice Bolt 5/8” x 3” – Galvanized 
Full Thread – Per 100 pieces

 $                                100.00 



 85
Splice Bolt 5/8” x 6” – Galvanized 
Full Thread – Per 100 pieces

 $                                125.00 

 86
Splice Bolt 5/8” x 9-1/2” – 
Galvanized 6” Thread – Per 100 
pieces

 $                                150.00 

 87
Splice Bolt 5/8” x 18” – Galvanized 
6” Thread – Per 100 pieces

 $                                260.00 

 88
Splice Bolt 5/8” x 25” – Galvanized 
6” Thread – Per 100 pieces

 $                                410.00 

 89
Washer 11/16” inside diameter and 
1-3/4” outside diameter – 
Galvanized – Per 100 pieces

 $                                  25.00 

 90
Washer 1-1/16” inside diameter and 
3” outside diameter – Galvanized – 
Per 100 pieces

 $                                  70.00 

 91
Nut 5/8” – Galvanized Recessed – 
Per 100 pieces

 $                                  40.00 

 92
Nut 1” – Galvanized Recessed – Per 
100 pieces

 $                                115.00 

 93
Treated Wood Post 6” x 8” x 6’ long 
– CRT Post drilled for 5/8” post bolt

 $                                  38.00 

 94
Treated Wood Post 6” x 8” x 6’ long 
– CRT Line Post drilled for 5/8” 
post bolt

 $                                  40.00 

 95
Treated Wood Post 5-1/2” x 7-1/2” 
x 3’6-3/4” long – Short Post drilled 
for 5/8” post bolt

 $                                  27.00 

96
IBM Guardrail Reflector, fits top of 
steel I-Beam Post

 NO BID 

97
Butterfly Guardrail Reflector, fits 
inside all “W-Beam”  steel guardrail

 NO BID 

98
The Flex 2020, fastens to composite 
block and concrete barriers

 NO BID 

99 (F3000), Impact Head, Fleat 350  NO BID 

100
(F1303), W-Beam Guardrail End 
Section, 12 Ga., 12’-6”

 NO BID 



101
(F1304), W-Beam Guardrail, Center 
Section (4’-2” spacing) 12 Ga., 12’-
6”

 NO BID 

102
(G1203), W-Beam Guardrail, (6’-3” 
spacing) 12 Ga., 12’-6”

 NO BID 

103
(S730), *  Foundation Soil Tubes, 
6” x 8” x 6’-0”

 NO BID 

104
(E750),  Bearing Plate – 8” x 8” x 
5/8”

 NO BID 

105 (S760), Cable Anchor Bracket  NO BID 
106 (E780), Ground Strut  NO BID 

107
((P650), 5-1/2” x 7-1/2” x 45” 
Wood Posts

 NO BID 

108
5/8” Flat Washers, (2 each at Soil 
Tubes + 6 Posts)

 NO BID 

109 (W100), 1” Anchor Cable Washers  NO BID 

110 (E350), 3/8” X 3” Lag Screws  NO BID 

111
(W050A), 1-1/16” OD x 9/16” ID 
A325 Structural Washers

 NO BID 

112 (S3000), Impact Head  NO BID 

113
(30G), W-Beam Guardrail, 12 Ga., 
12-6”

 $                                142.00 

114
(39G), W-Beam guardrail, 12 Ga., 
12’-6”

 $                                147.00 

115
Splice Bolt 5/8” x 21/2” – 
Galvanized Full Thread – Per 100 
pieces

 $                                300.00 

116
Splice Bolt 5/8” x 4” – Galvanized 
Full Thread – Per 100 pieces

 $                                150.00 

117
W6x20 post 36” tall center mount 
on 12”x12”x1”plate w/ 1” mounting 
holes, Galvanized

 $                                225.00 

118
W6x20 post 36” tall center mount 
on 12”x12”x1”plate w/ 1” mounting 
holes, Weathered

 $                                225.00 

119
W6x20 post 36” tall offset mount 
Galvanized as per attached sketch

 $                                240.00 

120
W6x20 post 36” tall offset mount 
Weathered as per attached sketch

 $                                240.00 

121 SRT 350 6 post System  $                             1,500.00 



122 (907G) (Terminal) Rolled Buffer  $                                  32.00 

123
Striped reflector (yellow/black) 16” 
x 16” adhesive

 $                                  25.00 

124
Complete Fleet SP Terminal end 2 
post system

 NO BID 

125
Complete SKT – SP Terminal end 2 
post system

 NO BID 

126 S3000 Impact Head  NO BID 
127 F3000 Impact Head  NO BID 

128
SF1303 W-Beam guardrail end 
section 12’6”

 NO BID 

129 TPHP1A First post top  NO BID 
130 TPHP1B First post Bottom  NO BID 
131 HP2A Second post assembly Top  NO BID 

132 HP3B Second post assembly bottom  NO BID 

133
B580904A  5/8 Diameter x 9 Hex 
bolt GRD 5

 NO BID 

134
B340854A  ¾ Diameter x  8 ½ Hex 
bolt GRD A449

 NO BID 

135 N030 ¾ Diameter Hex Nut  NO BID 

136
B5160104A 5/16 x 1 Hex Bolt GRD 
5

 NO BID 

137 W0516 5/16 Washer  NO BID 
138 N0516 5/16 Hex Nut  NO BID 

139
W to Thrie Beam Transition section 
Galvanized

 $                                  90.00 

140
Thrie Terminal connector 
Galvanized

 $                                  60.00 

141 W6 x 9 Post Galvanized  $                                  32.00 

142

Galvanized Type-B 9-Post Thie-
Beam Guide Rail Attachment 
Complete with W-Thrie Transition 
Section as Detailed in the NJDOT 
2007 Standard Construction Details 
CD-609-16

 $                                145.00 

Any questions (items 143-170) 
please contact- Chris Markley,  

Mercer County @ 609-989-6710:    

PN DESCRIPTION



143
3G   12/12"/BACKUP (GUARD 
RAIL)

20.00$                                           

144
30G   12/12'6/S SRT-1 (GUARD 
RAIL)

140.00$                                         

145
69G   12/25' S SRT-2 (GUARD 
RAIL)

200.00$                                         

146
700A  CABLE ANCHOR 
BRACKET 

35.00$                                           

147
907G   12/BUFFER/ROLLED 
(TERMINAL) GLOVE END 

35.00$                                           

148 3000G 3/4 X 6'6 CABLE 95.00$                                           

149 3300G  5/8" WASHER 0.30$                                             

150 3340G 5/8" HEX NUT 0.60$                                             

151 3360G  5/8 X 1-1/4" SPLICE SOLT 0.60$                                             

152
3380G  5/8 X 1-1/2" HEX HD 
BOLT

0.75$                                             

153 3400G  5/8” X 2" POST BOLT 0.65$                                             

154 3580G  5/8" X 18" POST BOLT 3.95$                                             

155 3701G  3/4" WASHER 0.30$                                             

156 3704G  3/4" HEX NUT 1.25$                                             

157
3718G  3/4" X 3" HEX HD BOLT 
(A325)

2.00$                                             

158 3900G  1" WASHER 1.00$                                             

159 3910G  1" HEX NUT 2.00$                                             

160 40638  6'0 POST 6 X 8 50.00$                                           

161 40758  14" BLOCK 6X8 9.00$                                             

162 4254G  3/8" WASHER 0.25$                                             

163 4258G  3/8" LOCKWASHER 0.25$                                             

164
4261G  3/8" X 1-1/2" HEX HD 
BOLT (GR 5)

0.50$                                             

165 4699G  3/4" LOCKWASHER 0.40$                                             

166
6321G 3/8” X 2" HEX HD BOLT 
(GR 5)

0.50$                                             

167 6405G  3/8" HEX NUT 0.40$                                             

168 9960G  SLOT GUARD 35.00$                                           

169
9961G  3/8 X 3 X 4 PLATE 
\WASHER

10.00$                                           

170
33876A  HBA POST 1 TOP (W6 X 
8.5)

60.00$                                           

171
33877A  HBA POST 2 TOP (W6 X 
8.5)

58.00$                                           



172
33878A2  HBA POST 1 & 2 BOT 
(TS 6 X 4)

145.00$                                         

173
33879G2  ANGLE STRUT 2 X 2 X 
3/8

66.00$                                           


	Bid Tabulation Sheet  CC-0039-17 Guide Rail
	CC-0039-17 CHEMUNG SUPPLY  EXCEL

