
Total Bids Received: 3
Signed 

Proposal

Stock 

Disclose

Non-

Collusion

Affirm 

Action NJ BRC IRAN CD/USB

Willing 

Co-Op Excep. Notes

Nielsen Dodge - C.J.R.

175 Route 10

East Hanover, NJ 07936

X X X X X X X Y None

Engine Land

155 Division Street

Elizabeth, NJ 07201

X X X 55870 X X X Y None

DFFLM LLC

Motor Right Auto Parts

215 Route 202/31

Flemington, NJ 08822

X X X 6512 X X Y Noted

BID TABULATION SHEET

Title:  Vehicle Parts and Repairs – Original Equipment Manufactured (OEM), Open-Ended
Opening Date:  Wednesday, March 14, 2018 at 2:30 p.m.

Contract #:  CC-0012-18



Vendor Price Per Hour % Off List Price Price Per Hour % Off List Price Price Per Hour % Off List Price Price Per Hour % Off List Price Price Per Hour % Off List Price Price Per Hour % Off List Price Price Per Hour % Off List Price Price Per Hour % Off List Price

A Cars Labor Rate
Nielsen Dodge 

Chrysler Jeep
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $110.00 $110.00 NO BID NO BID

A Cars Labor Rate Engine Land Inc. $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00

A Cars Labor Rate
DFFLM LLC, Motor 

Right Auto Parts
$102.88 $102.88 $102.88 $102.88 $102.88 $102.88 $102.88

B
Trucks up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine- 

Labor Rate

Nielsen Dodge 

Chrysler Jeep
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $110.00 $110.00 NO BID NO BID

B
Trucks up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine- 

Labor Rate
Engine Land Inc. $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00

B
Trucks up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine- 

Labor Rate

DFFLM LLC, Motor 

Right Auto Parts
$102.88 $102.88 $102.88 $102.88 $102.88 $102.88 $102.88

C
Trucks up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine- 

Labor Rate

Nielsen Dodge 

Chrysler Jeep
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $110.00 $110.00 NO BID NO BID

C
Trucks up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine- 

Labor Rate
Engine Land Inc. $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00

C
Trucks up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine- 

Labor Rate

DFFLM LLC, Motor 

Right Auto Parts
$127.88 $127.88 $127.88 $127.88 $127.88 $127.88 $127.88

D
Vans up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine- 

Labor Rate

Nielsen Dodge 

Chrysler Jeep
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $110.00 $110.00 NO BID NO BID

D
Vans up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine- 

Labor Rate
Engine Land Inc. $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00

D
Vans up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine- 

Labor Rate

DFFLM LLC, Motor 

Right Auto Parts
$102.88 $102.88 $102.88 $102.88 $102.88 $102.88 $102.88

E
Vans up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine- 

Labor Rate

Nielsen Dodge 

Chrysler Jeep
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $110.00 $110.00 NO BID NO BID

E
Vans up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine- 

Labor Rate
Engine Land Inc. $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00

E
Vans up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine- 

Labor Rate

DFFLM LLC, Motor 

Right Auto Parts
$127.88 $127.88 $127.88 $127.88 $127.88 $127.88 $127.88

F
Buses up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine- 

Labor Rate

Nielsen Dodge 

Chrysler Jeep
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $110.00 $110.00 NO BID NO BID

F
Buses up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine- 

Labor Rate
Engine Land Inc. $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00

F
Buses up to 14,500 GVW Gas Engine- 

Labor Rate

DFFLM LLC, Motor 

Right Auto Parts
$127.88 $127.88 $127.88 $127.88 $127.88 $127.88 $127.88

G
Buses up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine- 

Labor Rate

Nielsen Dodge 

Chrysler Jeep
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $110.00 $110.00 NO BID NO BID

G
Buses up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine- 

Labor Rate
Engine Land Inc. $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00

G
Buses up to 14,500 GVW Diesel Engine- 

Labor Rate

DFFLM LLC, Motor 

Right Auto Parts
$127.88 $127.88 $127.88 $127.88 $127.88 $127.88 $127.88

H Hybrid Labor Rate
Nielsen Dodge 

Chrysler Jeep
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $110.00 $110.00 NO BID NO BID

H Hybrid Labor Rate Engine Land Inc. $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00

H Hybrid Labor Rate
DFFLM LLC, Motor 

Right Auto Parts
$127.88 $127.88 $127.88 $127.88 $127.88 $127.88 $127.88

K Diagnostic Time-No Repairs
Nielsen Dodge 

Chrysler Jeep
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $95.00 $95.00 NO BID NO BID

K Diagnostic Time-No Repairs Engine Land Inc. $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00

K Diagnostic Time-No Repairs
DFFLM LLC, Motor 

Right Auto Parts
$102.88 $102.88 $102.88 $102.88 $102.88 $102.88 $102.88

I
Percentage of discount for OEM parts when 

used in the repair of vehicles

Nielsen Dodge 

Chrysler Jeep
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 32% 32% NO BID NO BID

I
Percentage of discount for OEM parts when 

used in the repair of vehicles
Engine Land Inc. 20% 20% 20% 20% 20% 20% 20% 20%

I
Percentage of discount for OEM parts when 

used in the repair of vehicles

DFFLM LLC, Motor 

Right Auto Parts
37.3% 35.6% 35.6% 35.6% 35.6% 35.6% 35.6% 35.6%

J
Percentage of discount for OEM parts when 

picked up / No Repairs (Over the Counter)

Nielsen Dodge 

Chrysler Jeep
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 32% 32% NO BID NO BID

J
Percentage of discount for OEM parts when 

picked up / No Repairs (Over the Counter)
Engine Land Inc. 20% 20% 20% 20% 20% 20% 20% 20%

J
Percentage of discount for OEM parts when 

picked up / No Repairs (Over the Counter)

DFFLM LLC, Motor 

Right Auto Parts
37.3% 35.6% 35.6% 35.6% 35.6% 35.6% 35.6% 35.6%

Vehicle Parts and Repairs – Original Equipment Manufactured 

(OEM) GMC Parts and RepairsFord Parts and Repairs Chevrolet Parts and Repairs Buick Parts and Repairs  Pontiac Parts and Repairs  Dodge Parts and Repairs  Jeep Parts and Repairs Toyota Parts and Repairs
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