
Total Bids Received: 5
Signed 

Proposal

Stock 

Disclose

Non-

Collusion

Affirm 

Action NJ BRC IRAN CD/USB

Willing 

Co-op Excep. Notes

Tera Consulting Inc

185 West John St, #7111

Hicksville, NY 11802

X X X 58576 X X X Y None

Office Concepts Group Inc. 

301 Greenwood Avenue

Midland Park, NJ 07432

X X X 46521 X X X Y None

Busch Systems International Inc

81 Rawson Ave

Barrie, ON Canada L4N6E5

X X X X X X X Y None

The Office Pal

1000 Airport Road, Suite 201

Lakewood,  NJ  08701

X X X X X Y None

W.B. Mason

535 Secaucus Road

Secaucus, NJ 07094

X X X 28060 X X X Y None

BID TABULATION SHEET

Title:  Office Supplies, Furniture & Equipment, Printer Ink Cartridge & Toner Just-In Time, Desktop Delivery, Open End, Catalogue Bid

Opening Date:  Tuesday, April 24, 2018  at  2:30 P.M.

Contract #:  CC-0001-18



Vendor Name: Tera Consulting Office Concepts Group Busch Systems International The Office Pal W.B. Mason

PERCENTAGE (%) Discount PERCENTAGE (%) Discount PERCENTAGE (%) Discount PERCENTAGE (%) Discount PERCENTAGE (%) Discount

1 Office Supplies – Daily Use *Category Percentage not identified 49.50% NO BID NO BID 66.10%

2 Electronics & Technology Supplies *Category Percentage not identified 44.50% NO BID NO BID 37.50%

3 Ink & Toner *Category Percentage not identified 35.50% NO BID 25.00% 43.10%

4 Furniture & Accessories *Category Percentage not identified 50.65% NO BID NO BID 52.50%

5 All Purpose Maintenance Supplies *Category Percentage not identified 41.70% 10.00%  *On Receptacles only NO BID 42.50%

6 Breakroom Supplies *Category Percentage not identified 38.80% NO BID NO BID 40.10%

7
Breakroom Small Appliances & 

Equipment
*Category Percentage not identified 25.70% NO BID NO BID 40.10%

8
First Aid Supplies & Personal 

Protection Products
*Category Percentage not identified 25.80% NO BID NO BID 41.50%

9 Specialty Purpose Paper *Category Percentage not identified 32.80% NO BID NO BID 32.50%

10 Miscellaneous *Category Percentage not identified 20.90% NO BID NO BID 49.60%

NO BID 43.00% NO BID NO BID NO BID

No percentage discount identified NO BID NO BID NO BID 37.10%

www.teraofficesolutions.com www.officeconceptsgroup.com
https://busch-

systems.myshopify.com
www.wbmason.com

www.biggestbook.com www.biggestbook.com www.buschsystems.com www.biggestbook.com www.biggestbook.com

E-catalog Web Address

State a website for list price verification

(For Example  www.biggestbook.com)

Office Supplies, Furniture & Equipment, Printer Ink Cartridge & Toner

Just-In Time, Desktop Delivery, Open End, Catalogue Bid

Contract #CC-0001-18

S.P. Richards Office Products Catalogue 

% Discount For Catalogue Items Not Listed

Essendant Company Catalogues

% Discount For Catalogue Items Not Listed

Category
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