
 



Item # Description
Bidder 

Company Name

Price per 

Pound $
Pkg for Unit Qty per Unit

Price Per 

Unit $
Brand Bidding MFR Number

1 BREAD:  DELI ROLLS  Mivila 1 dz  5.95 per dozen R.B. 880708---Kaiser Roll

2 BREAD:  FRENCH BREAD - UNSLICED LOAF No Bid

3
BREAD:  HAMBURGER BUNS WHITE- SLICED 12 

PER BAG
Mivila 1 dz 2.50 per dozen Rockland Bakery 310500

4
BREAD:  HAMBURGER BUNS WHOLE WHEAT - 

SLICED
Mivila 1 dz 3.95 per dozen Rockland Bakery 310502

5 BREAD:  HOAGIE ROLLS  12 INCH Mivila 1 each 1.50 each Rockland Bakery 310512

6
BREAD:  HOT DOG ROLLS WHITE- SLICED 12 PER 

BAG
Mivila 1 dz 1.95 per dozen Sabrett 310504

7
BREAD:  HOT DOG ROLLS WHOLE WHEAT - 

SLICED
Mivila 1 dz 3.89 per dozen Rockland Bakery 310503

8 BREAD:  ITALIAN BREAD – UNSLICED LOAF No Bid

9 BREAD:  POTRUGUESE ROLLS DOZEN Mivila 1 dz 6.95 per dozen Rockland Bakery 310550

10 BREAD:  RYE BREAD - SLICED Mivila 1 Loaf 3.95 per Loaf Rockland Bakery 310507

11 BREAD:  WHEAT BREAD - SLICED Mivila 1 1.5 oz Loaf 3.25 per Loaf Rockland Bakery 310515

12 BREAD:  WHITE BREAD - SLICED GIANT LOAF Mivila 1 1.5 oz Loaf 2.95 per Loaf Rockland Bakery 310505

13
BREAKFAST FOODS:  BACON, PORK SLICED 

BACON - 15 LB BOX
JAMAC $2.47 1 15 lb $37.05 CoverWagon 401516-116

14
BREAKFAST FOODS:  EGGS, LIQUID (WHOLE) 15-

2LB CONT/CASE
JAMAC $1.42 5 lb. 6 $42.60 Deb El 50000-94063

15
BREAKFAST FOODS:  FRENCH TOAST, FROZEN – 

1.5 OZ 144 in CASE
JAMAC 1.5 oz 144 $22.66 Echo Lake MF8000

16 BREAKFAST FOODS:  PANCAKES, FROZEN JAMAC 1.2 oz 144 $13.44 Echo Lake MF7000

17
BREAKFAST FOODS:  WAFFLES-BLUEBERRY  1.4 

OZ 120 in CASE
Mivila 96 1.25 oz 21.85 per case Eggo 880523

18
BREAKFAST FOODS:  WAFFLES-PLAIN, FROZEN  

1.4 OZ 144 in CASE
JAMAC 1.4 oz 144 $14.10 Echo Lake MF9000

19 BUTTER:   P/C CUPS 5 GRAM Mivila 3.79 per lb 8 lb Sommermaid 190708

20 BUTTER:  1 LB BLOCKS Mivila 2.89 per lb 36 1 lb Sommermaid 190701

21 BUTTER:  PATS Mivila 3.69 per lb 17 lb Sommermaid 190719

22
CHEESE:  CHEDDAR – SHARP-SHREDDED 5 LB 

BAG
Mivila 2.3 per lb 6 5 lb Sommermaid 192135

23
CHEESE:  MOZZARELLA-WHOLE MILK-

SHREDDED 5 LB BAG
Mivila 2.25 per lb 6 5 lb Sommermaid 192127

Perishable Food for the County Jail

Contract #:  JCC-0010-18

Master Schedule of Prices 
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24 CONDIMENTS:  COLE SLAW 10 LB CONT Mivila 1.28 per lb 8 lb Sally Sherman 650703

25 CONDIMENTS:  CROUTONS - SEASONED 1B BAGS Mivila 4 2.25 lb 20.5 per case Fresh Gourmet 170699

26
CONDIMENTS:  PARMESAN CHEES - GRATED 

16OZ CONTAINERS
Karetas Foods LLC Case 12 $37.50 Sommer Maid 29351

27 DAIRY:  COTTAGE CHEESE – LOW FAT 5LB CONT. Mivila 8.15 per lb 5 lb C-O-L 191912

28 DAIRY:  COTTAGE CHEESE – NON FAT 1LB CONT No Bid

29 DAIRY:  COTTAGE CHEESE – NON FAT 5LB CONT. No Bid

30 DAIRY:  COTTAGE CHEESE – REGULAR 1LB CONT No Bid

31
DAIRY:  COTTAGE CHEESE – REGULAR 5LB 

CONT.
Mivila 8.15 per lb 5 lb C-O-L 191901

32 DAIRY:  COTTAGE CHEESE:  LOW FAT 1LB CONT No Bid

33 DAIRY:  CREAM CHEESE 1 LB LOAF No Bid

34 DAIRY:  CREAM CHEESE 3 LB LOAF Karetas Foods LLC case 10 $64.00 Sommer Maid 64465

35
DAIRY:  CREAM CHEESE, INDIVIDUAL SERVING 

CONT. 100 PER CASE
Cardinal Foods 100 / 1 oz $17.50 Packer

36 DAIRY:  EGGS- FRESH 15 DOZ CTN Karetas Foods LLC case 15 $24.50 Martins 70230

37 DAIRY:  HEAVY CREAM - 1QT Mivila 12 1 qt 45.85 per case 191913

38 DAIRY:  MILK 1% – ½ PINT Mivila 70 8 oz 21.85 per case C-O-L 450415

39 DAIRY:  MILK 2% – ½ PINT Mivila 70 8 oz 21.85 per case C-O-L 450418

40 DAIRY:  MILK CHOCOLATE - 1PT SERVING Mivila 70 8 oz 21.85 per case C-O-L 450452----Fat Free

41 DAIRY:  MILK LACTAID MILK 4OZ Mivila 20 8 oz 18.95 per case Lactaid 450484

42 DAIRY:  MILK SKIM – ½ PINT Mivila 70 8 oz 25.95 per case C-O-L 450424

43 DAIRY:  MILK SOY - 8.45OZ Mivila 18 8 oz 25.95 per case Silk *Aseptic*
450216----Vanilla or 

Chocolate

44 DAIRY:  MILK WHOLE – ½ PINT Mivila 70 8 oz 25.95 per case C-O-L 450403

45 DAIRY:  YOGURT-FRUIT YOGURT 6OZ Karetas Foods LLC case 12 $11.00 Yopliat 70628

46 DAIRY:  YOGURT-PLAIN YOGURT 6OZ No Bid

47 DELI MEAT:  CHICKEN ROLL– WHOLE UNSLICED Mivila 3 5 lb #4116778

48 DELI MEATS:  BOILED HAM– WHOLE UNSLICED Mivila 1.79 per lb Avg. 13 lb Hormel 650507

49
DELI MEATS:  BOLOGNA-BEEF – WHOLE 

UNSLICED
JAMAC $2.92 10 lb. $29.20 Farmland 70247821000
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50
DELI MEATS:  BOLOGNA-SHICKHAUS-ALL MEAT– 

WHOLE UNSLICED
JAMAC $2.96 10 lb. $29.60 Farmland 7024782

51 DELI MEATS:  CAPACOLA– WHOLE UNSLICED Mivila 3.19 per lb Avg. 6 lb Prima Porta 650505----**HOT**

52 DELI MEATS:  HAM, PIT HAM– WHOLE UNSLICED Mivila 2.79 per lb Avg. 18 lb Farmland 650508

53
DELI MEATS:  HAM, TAVERN HAM– WHOLE 

UNSLICED
Mivila 2.99 per lb Hatfield #2293

54 DELI MEATS:  LIVERWURST– WHOLE UNSLICED Mivila 1.98 per lb Avg. 4 lb Hatfield 970703

55 DELI MEATS:  PEPPERONI – WHOLE UNSLICED Mivila 3.98 per lb Avg. 3 lb Leoni 970110

56 DELI MEATS:  PROSCUITTO– WHOLE UNSLICED Mivila 6.39 per lb Avg. 5 lb 650514

57 DELI MEATS:  ROAST BEEF– WHOLE UNSLICED Mivila 3.98 per lb Avg. 7.5 lb Reesler 650526

58
DELI MEATS:  SALAMI – GENOA– WHOLE 

UNSLICED
JAMAC $3.42 6 lb. 3 $61.56 Carando 10268

59
DELI MEATS:  SALAMI – HARD– WHOLE 

UNSLICED
JAMAC $2.82 5 lb. 3 $42.30 Farmland 33047

60 DELI MEATS:  SPICED HAM– WHOLE UNSLICED JAMAC $2.99 10 lb. 5 $149.50 Farmland 29023

61
DELI MEATS:  TURKEY BREAST– WHOLE 

UNSLICED
JAMAC $1.56 10 lb. 2 $31.20 Carolina 81476

62 DELI MEATS:  VIRGINIA HAM– WHOLE UNSLICED JAMAC $2.77 13 lb. 2 $72.02 Farmland 29015

63 DELI:  CHEESE SWISS - BLOCK JAMAC $3.22 8 lb. 6 Laubscher 14

64
DELI:  CHEESE SWISS-ALPINE LACE SWISS 

CHEESE (BLOCK)
Mivila 5.35 per lb 10 lb Packer Label #9

65
DELI:  CHEESE WHITE AMERICAN CHEESE – 120 

SLICE 5 LB
JAMAC $2.10 5 lb. 4 $42.00 Bongards 10050

66
DELI:  CHEESE YELLOW AMERICAN CHEESE – 120 

SLICE 5 LB
JAMAC $2.10 5 lb. 4 $42.00 Bongards 10049

67 FROZEN FOODS:  BURRITOS BEAN - FROZEN JAMAC 50 5.5 oz $47.12 Ruiz 06221

68
FROZEN FOODS:  BURRITOS BEEF AND BEAN - 

FROZEN 
JAMAC 50 5.78 oz $47.12 Ruiz 01329

69 FROZEN FOODS:  BURRITOS BEEF-FROZEN JAMAC 24 5 oz $24.60 ButcherBOy 5171401

70 FROZEN FOODS:  MOZARELLA STICKS, BREADED Karetas Foods LLC Case 6 $30.50 Lake Erie 190097

71
FROZEN FOODS:  ONION RINGS:  BATTER DIPPED 

WHOLE ONION RINGS
JAMAC $1.37 10 lb. 1 lb $13.70 Country Acre 33028

72
FROZEN FOODS:  POCKETS CHEESE & BROCCOLI 

POCKETS
No Bid

73 FROZEN SOUP:  CHICKEN RICE Mivila 4 4 lb 46.85 per case Chef Francisco 872165

74 FROZEN SOUP:  CREAM OF BROCCOLI Mivila 4 4 lb 39.85 per case Chef Francisco 872160

75 FROZEN SOUP:  ESCAROLE Mivila 4 4 lb 36.95 per case Chef Francisco
872127---Parm Soup 

w/Italian Sausage
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76 FROZEN SOUP:  FIRE ROASTED VEGETABLE JAMAC 4 4 lb. $41.60 Blount 78026

77 FROZEN SOUP:  ITALIAN WEDDING Mivila 4 4 lb 41.00 per case Chef Francisco 872186

78 FROZEN SOUP:  LENTIL BEAN Mivila 4 4 lb 48.00 per case Chef Francisco
872161---Lentil 

Mediterranean

79
FROZEN SOUP:  MANHATTAN CLAM CHOWDER 

SOUP 
Mivila 4 4 lb 41.00 per case Chef Francisco 872172

80 FROZEN SOUP:  NEW ENGLAND CLAM CHOWDER Mivila 4 4 lb 41.00 per case Chef Francisco 872174

81 FROZEN SOUP:  ONION SOUP Mivila 4 4 lb 38.75 per case Chef Francisco 872182

82 FROZEN SOUP:  PASTA FAGIOLI Mivila 4 4 lb 41.00 per case Chef Francisco 872158

83 FROZEN SOUP:  POTATO Mivila 4 4 lb 41.50 per case Chef Francisco 872181

84 FROZEN SOUP:  POTATO BACON Mivila 4 4 lb 36.90 per case Chef Francisco 872192

85 FROZEN SOUP:  SEAFOOD BISQUE Mivila 4 4 lb 51.00 per case Chef Francisco
872166----Lobster Crab 

Bisque

86 FROZEN SOUP:  YANKEE BEAN Mivila 4 4 lb 42.90 per case Chef Francisco 872155---Bean & Ham

87
FROZEN:  POCKETS CHICKEN, CHEESE & 

BROCCOLI POCKETS
No Bid

88 FRUIT:  APPLES-EMPIRE Gargiulo Produce Case 120 $32.00 Packer

89 FRUIT:  APPLES-GOLDEN DELICIOUS Gargiulo Produce Case 120 $36.00 Packer

90 FRUIT:  APPLES-GRANNY SMITH Gargiulo Produce Case 100 $38.00 Packer

91 FRUIT:  APPLES-RED DELICIOUS Gargiulo Produce Case 125 $32.00 Packer

92 FRUIT:  APPLES-ROME Gargiulo Produce Case 88 $32.00 Packer

93 FRUIT:  BANANAS Gargiulo Produce Case 100 $24.00 Packer

94 FRUIT:  BLUEBERRIES Gargiulo Produce Case 12 pt $36.00 Packer

95 FRUIT:  CANTALOUPES Gargiulo Produce Case 12 ct $19.00 Packer

96 FRUIT:  CHERRIES Gargiulo Produce Case 18 lb $45.00 Packer

97 FRUIT:  CLEMENTINES Gargiulo Produce Case 30 lb $45.00 Packer

98 FRUIT:  GRAPEFRUIT-RED Gargiulo Produce Case 40 ct $36.00 Packer

99 FRUIT:  GRAPES-RED Gargiulo Produce Case 18 lb $28.00 Packer

100 FRUIT:  GRAPES-WHITE Gargiulo Produce Case 18 lb $28.00 Packer

101 FRUIT:  HONEYDEW Gargiulo Produce Case 5 ct $17.00 Packer
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102 FRUIT:  KIWI Gargiulo Produce Case 32 ct $12.00 Packer

103 FRUIT:  LEMONS Gargiulo Produce Case 165 $42.00 Packer

104 FRUIT:  LIMES Gargiulo Produce Case 48 ct $18.00 Packer

105 FRUIT:  NECTARINES Gargiulo Produce Case 64 ct $32.00 Packer

106 FRUIT:  ORANGES Gargiulo Produce Case 113 ct $36.00 Packer

107 FRUIT:  PEACHES Gargiulo Produce Case 80 ct $32.00 Packer

108 FRUIT:  PEARS Gargiulo Produce Case 120 ct $39.00 Packer

109 FRUIT:  PLUMS Gargiulo Produce Case 120 $32.00 Packer

110 FRUIT:  STRAWBERRIES Gargiulo Produce Case 12 ct $27.00 Packer

111 FRUIT:  TANGERINES Gargiulo Produce Case 120 ct $34.00 Packer

112 FRUIT:  WATERMELON Gargiulo Produce Each 15 lb $10.50 Packer

113
JUICE CUPS:  APPLE - FROZEN JUICE CUP-4OZ / 96 

per CASE
Mivila 72 4oz 9.15 per case Sun Cup 930312

114
JUICE CUPS:  CRANBERRY FROZEN JUICE CUP-

4OZ 96 PER CASE
Karetas Foods LLC case 72 $8.75 Sun Cup 220050

115
JUICE CUPS:  FRUIT PUNCH -FROZEN JUICE CUP-

4OZ / 96 PER CASE 
Mivila 72 4 oz 7.95 per case Sun Cup 930318

116
JUICE CUPS:  GRAPE - FROZEN JUICE CUP-4OZ / 

GRAPE 96 PER CASE 
Karetas Foods LLC case 72 $10.15 Sun Cup 220080

117
JUICE CUPS:  GRAPEFRUIT FROZEN JUICE CUP-

4OZ / 96 PER CASE 
JAMAC 4 oz. 72 $12.40 Suncup

118
JUICE CUPS:  ORANGE - FROZEN JUICE CUP-4OZ 

96 per CASE
Mivila 72 4 oz 9.95 per case Sun Cup 930306

119
JUICE CUPS:  PINEAPPLE-FROZEN JUICE CUP-4OZ 

/ ORANGE PINEAPPLE 96 per CASE
Mivila 72 4 oz 11.75 per case Sun Cup 930344

120
JUICE CUPS:  PRUNE - FROZEN JUICE CUP-4OZ / 

PRUNE 96 per CASE
Mivila 72 4 oz 14.60 per case Sun Cup 930335

121
KOSHER MEALS:  BAKED ZITI, Kosher 10OZ MEALS 

6 MEALS/CASE
JAMAC 10 oz. 6 $24.20 Meal Mart

122
KOSHER MEALS:  BRISKET BEEF DINNER, 

KOSHER 12OZ MEALS / 12 MEALS/CASE   
JAMAC 12 oz. 12 $80.00 Meal Mart

123
KOSHER MEALS:  CHEESE SANDWICH, KOSHER - 

12 SANDWICHES/CASE
JAMAC 12 oz. 12 $42.00 Meal Mart

124
KOSHER MEALS:  CHICKEN SOUP, KOSHER 9OZ 

CUPS / 12 CUPS/CASE
JAMAC 9 oz. 12 $30.00 Kosher Gourmet

125
KOSHER MEALS:  CHICKEN, ROASTED 12OZ 

MEALS 6 MEALS/CASE
JAMAC 12 oz. 6 $39.90 Meal Mart

126
KOSHER MEALS:  EGG SALAD, KOSHER 4OZ CUPS 

/ 24 CUPS/CASE
JAMAC 3.5 oz 24 $39.90 TUV-TAM

127
KOSHER MEALS:  EGGPLANT 12OZ MEALS - 12 

MEALS/CASE
Karetas Foods LLC case 6 $26.00 Meal Mart 324625

Page 5



Item # Description
Bidder 

Company Name

Price per 

Pound $
Pkg for Unit Qty per Unit

Price Per 

Unit $
Brand Bidding MFR Number

128
KOSHER MEALS:  FISH, KOSHER 12OZ MEALS 12 

MEALS/CASE
Karetas Foods LLC case 12 $45.80 Meal Mart 605111

129
KOSHER MEALS:  KOSHER SPAGHETTI 12OZ 

MEALS 6MEALS/CASE 
Karetas Foods LLC case 12 $49.00 Meal Mart 344532

130
KOSHER MEALS:  KOSHER STUFFED CABBAGE 

12OZ MEALS 6MEALS/CASE 
Karetas Foods LLC case 12 $39.55 Meal Mart 324813

131
KOSHER MEALS:  KOSHER STUFFED SHELLS / 

12OZ MEALS 12MEALS/CASE 
Karetas Foods LLC case 12 $44.50 Meal Mart 605127

132
KOSHER MEALS:  KOSHER TOMATOR SOUP 9OZ 

CUPS  12CUPS/CASE
JAMAC 9 oz. 12 $32.00 TUV-TAM

133
KOSHER MEALS:  KOSHER VEG STUFFED 

CABBAGE / 12OZ  MEALS 12 MEALS/CASE
Karetas Foods LLC case 12 $39.50 Meal Mart 605123

134
KOSHER MEALS:  KOSHER VEG. SALISBURY 

STEAK  / 10OZ MEALS 6 MEALS/CASE 
Karetas Foods LLC case 12 $41.20 Meal Mart 344531

135
KOSHER MEALS:  LOMEIN, KOSHER 12OZ MEALS 

12MEALS/CASE 
Karetas Foods LLC case 12 $45.80 Meal Mart 605116

136
KOSHER MEALS:  MAC & CHEESE 12OZ MEALS 12 

MEALS/CASE
JAMAC 12 oz. 12 $58.35 TUV-TAM

137
KOSHER MEALS:  MATZOH BALL SOUP 90Z CUPS 

12 CUPS/CASE 
Karetas Foods LLC case 12 $30.01 Meal Mart MMCKBRMBDMW

138
KOSHER MEALS:  MEATLOAF 12OZ MEALS - 12 

MEALS/CASE
Karetas Foods LLC case 12 $45.00 Meal Mart 605117

139
KOSHER MEALS:  PASTA PRIMAVERA, KOSHER 

12OZ MEALS 12 MEALS/CASE
JAMAC 12 oz. 12 $58.35 TUV-TAM

140
KOSHER MEALS:  POT ROAST, KOSHER 13OZ 

MEALS 6 MEALS/CASE
Karetas Foods LLC case 6 $31.50 Meal Mart 324618

141
KOSHER MEALS:  SALISBURY STEAK 12OZ 

MEALS - 6 MEALS/CASE
Karetas Foods LLC case 12 $36.50 Meal Mart 324807

142
KOSHER MEALS:  SPAGHETTI & MEATBALLS 

13OZ MEALS 6 MEALS/CASE
Karetas Foods LLC case 12 $43.20 Meal Mart 605119

143
KOSHER MEALS:  STUFFED VEGETABLE PEPPERS 

12OZ MEALS - 12 MEALS/CASE
Karetas Foods LLC case 6 $29.75 Meal Mart 344541

145
KOSHER MEALS:  VEGETABLE SOUP 90Z CUPS 12 

CUPS/CASE
JAMAC 9 oz. 12 $33.90 TUV-TAM

146
KOSHER MEALS:  VEGGIE VEAL STEAKS - 12OZ 

MEALS / 12 MEALS/CASE
JAMAC 12 oz. 6 $47.50 Meal Mart

147 MARGARINE:  OLEO BLOCKS 1 LB 30 / CASE Mivila 30 1 lb 20.90 per case Admiration 190900

148
MARGARINE:  OLEO REDDIES – 90 COUNT PER 

POUND 12 LB CASE
Mivila 2.10 per lb 12 lb Sommermaid 190929

149 MEAT:  BEEF CUBES 1”  – 10 LB BAG Cardinal Foods $3.65 10 lb 1 $36.50 Packer

150 MEAT:  BEEF STROGANOFF 4-6LB TRYS Mivila 61.90 per case Stuffers #12298010

151 MEAT:  BEEF, GROUND - 10 LB BAG Cardinal Foods $2.59 10 lb 1 $25.90 Packer

152 MEAT:  BOTTOM ROUNDS – 15 TO 20 LB AVG Mivila 3.19 per lb Avg. 13 lb IBP 972106

153 MEAT:  BURGERS 100 % BEEF - 6OZ Mivila 6oz/10 lb 25.90 per case Embassy 970513

154 MEAT:  BURGERS, BEEF - BREADED-4OZ JAMAC $6.60 4 oz. 40 $66.00 Advance
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155 MEAT:  BURGERS, CHICKEN (RAW) 4 OZ JAMAC $2.88 4 oz. 40 $28.80 Tyson

156 MEAT:  CHICKEN BREAST– WHOLE UNSLICED Mivila 3.89 per lb Avg. 5 lb Reesler 971406

157
MEAT:  CHICKEN BREAST, BREADED COOKED 

PCASE 
Cardinal Foods $1.74 20 lb 1 $34.80 Tyson

158
MEAT:  CHICKEN BREAST, COOKED UNBREADED 

PCASE
Cardinal Foods $2.10 20 lb 1 $42.00 Tyson

159
MEAT:  CHICKEN COOKED FROZEN W/ WILD RICE 

& CHEESE & HAM
Mivila 36 4 oz 48.85 per case Kock 971130

160
MEAT:  CHICKEN CUTLETS BREADED,COOKED 4 

OZ
Cardinal Foods $1.74 20 lb 1 $34.80 Tyson

161
MEAT:  CHICKEN CUTLETS, COOKED 

UNBREADED 
Cardinal Foods $2.10 20 lb 1 $42.00 Tyson

162
MEAT:  CHICKEN CUTLETS, UNBREADED 

RAW/FROZEN 
Cardinal Foods $3.89 12 lb 1 $46.68 Koch

163
MEAT:  CHICKEN CUTLETS, UNBREADED RAW-

FRESH 
Mivila 2.25 per lb 4 10 lb Packer Label 970954

164 MEAT:  CHICKEN HALVES, FRESH/ICED No Bid

165 MEAT:  CHICKEN HOT DOGS – 8/1 COUNT Cardinal Foods $2.89 30 lb 1 $86.70 Stahl Meyer

166 MEAT:  CHICKEN LEGS RAW/FRESH Mivila 1.25 per lb Avg. 41 lb Packer Label 970971

167 MEAT:  CHICKEN LEGS RAW/FROZEN Cardinal Foods $1.04 1 / 37.875 lb 1 $39.39 Simmons

170 MEAT:  CHICKEN NUGGETS, BREADED COOKED Karetas Foods LLC case 10 $17.00 Packer 341003

171
MEAT:  CHICKEN PATTIES, BREADED COOKED 4 

OZ
Cardinal Foods $1.72 20 lb 1 $34.40 Goldkist

172 MEAT:  CHICKEN QUARTERS, BREADED/COOKED JAMAC $3.00 15 lb. $45.00 Tyson 20730

173 MEAT:  CHICKEN QUARTERS, FRESH/ICED Mivila 1.89 per case Avg. 53 lb Mennellas 970948

174 MEAT:  CHICKEN STRIPS, COOKED BREADED Cardinal Foods $1.40 20 lb 1 $28.00 Tyson

175 MEAT:  CHICKEN STRIPS, COOKED UNBREADED Cardinal Foods $2.69 10 lb 1 $26.90 Packer

176 MEAT:  CHICKEN TENDERS, COOKED BREADED Cardinal Foods $1.34 20 lb 1 $26.80 Tyson

177
MEAT:  CHICKEN THIGHS, BREADED/COOKED 

PCASE
No Bid

178 MEAT:  CHICKEN THIGHS, COOKED PCASE No Bid

179 MEAT:  CHICKEN WINGS, BUFFALO COOKED Cardinal Foods $2.05 20 lb 1 $41.00 Tyson

180 MEAT:  CHICKEN WINGS, COOKED BARBECUE Cardinal Foods $2.05 20 lb 1 $41.00 Tyson

181 MEAT:  CHICKEN WINGS, COOKED PLAIN Cardinal Foods $2.05 20 lb 1 $41.00 Tyson

182 MEAT:  CHICKEN WINGS, COOKED UNBREADED Cardinal Foods $2.05 20 lb 1 $41.00 Tyson
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183 MEAT:  CHICKEN WINGS, FROZEN Cardinal Foods $1.80 20 lb 1 $36.00 Tyson

184 MEAT:  CHICKEN WINGS-RAW Mivila 2.59 per lb 40 lb Packer Label 970949

185
MEAT:  CHICKEN, COOKED FROZEN CHICKEN W/ 

WILD RICE & CHEESE
JAMAC $5.33 8 oz 24 $64.00 Barber 046858

186
MEAT:  CHICKEN, COOKED FROZEN W/ WILD 

RICE
No Bid

187 MEAT:  CHICKEN, WHOLE RAW/ICED Mivila 1.89 per lb 3 lb Shells 24 ct. Packer Label 970946

188 MEAT:  CORN DOG (BEEF NO STICK), FROZEN No Bid

189 MEAT:  CORN DOG NUGGETS (BEEF), FROZEN Mivila 240 .72 oz 43.85 per case State Fair #11000-----Beef & Pork

190 MEAT:  CORN DOGS (BEEF) FROZEN Mivila 48 4 oz 39.85 per case State Fair 970785

191 MEAT:  CORNED BEEF– WHOLE UNSLICED JAMAC $4.80 18 lb 8 $86.40 Nations Best

192 MEAT:  FRANKS - BEEF & PORK JAMAC $2.60 10 lb. $26.00 Farmland 812547

193 MEAT:  FRANKS, BEEF  – 8-1LB PACKAGE JAMAC $2.90 10 lb. $29.00 Farmland 810967

194 MEAT:  HOT DOG HEBREW NATIONAL KOSHER Mivila 3.65 per lb 8/1—4/5 lb Hebrew #9

195 MEAT:  KIELBASA – 10 LB BOX Mivila 2 Avg. 5 lb 26.40 per case Farmland 650521

196 MEAT:  MEATBALLS-BEEF .5OZ / 10 LB BOX Cardinal Foods $1.40 30 lb 1 $42.00 Silver Lake

197 MEAT:  MEATBALLS-BEEF 2 OZ / 10 LB BOX Cardinal Foods $1.40 30 lb 1 $42.00 Silver Lake

198 MEAT:  PORK CHOPS - CENTER CUT Mivila 5 oz/10 lb 29.50 per case Embassy 971725

199 MEAT:  PORK LOINS-WHOLE / 30 – 40 LB AVG JAMAC $2.19 14 lb. $30.66 Farmland 168787

200 MEAT:  PORK ROAST Mivila 2.59 per lb Avg. 16.75 lb IBP 970796----Pork Butt

201 MEAT:  PORK ROLL – WHOLE UNSLICED Mivila 4.19 per lb 2 6 lb Trenton 650510

202 MEAT:  PORK, GROUND - 10 LB BAG Mivila 1.99 per lb 10 lb Lipari 970795

203 MEAT:  ROAST, RIB EYE Mivila 9.85 per lb Avg. 16 lb IBP
972127----Rib Eye 

Boneless Choice

204 MEAT:  SAUSAGE LINKS, BREAKFAST 10 LB BOX Karetas Foods LLC case 10 $22.50 Hatfield

205 MEAT:  SAUSAGE, BEEF SAUSAGE- 10 LB BAG Karetas Foods LLC case 10 $22.50 Packer

206
MEAT:  SAUSAGE, ITALIAN PORK SAUSAGE- 10 

LB BAG
Cardinal Foods $2.29 10 lb 1 $22.90 Torino

207 MEAT:  STEAKUMS 4OZ - 10LB CASES JAMAC $2.80 4 oz. 40 $28.00 B+M

208 MEAT:  TOP ROUNDS – 15 TO 20 LB AVG Mivila 3.09 per lb Avg. 25 lb IBP 972167
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209
MEAT:  TURKEY BREAST, RAW (IN BAG 9-12 LB 

AVG)
Cardinal Foods $2.72 20 lb avg 1 $2.72 lb Carolina 

210 MEAT:  TURKEY BURGERS (RAW) 4 OZ Mivila 4 oz/10 lb 19.80 per case Perdue 970936

211 MEAT:  TURKEY HOT DOGS – 8/1 COUNT JAMAC $1.12 20 lb $22.40 Jennie-O

212 MEAT:  TURKEY LEGS-RAW/ICED No Bid

213 MEAT:  TURKEY MEAT, GROUND (RAW) Cardinal Foods $0.79 40 lb 1 $31.60 Packer

214 MEAT:  TURKEY ROLL– WHOLE UNSLICED Mivila 2/Avg. 10 lb 29.80 per case Perdue 970830

215 MEAT:  TURKEY, WHOLE - FROZEN Mivila 1.50 per lb Packer Label 970806

216 MEAT:  VEAL PATTIES BREADED- 4OZ Mivila 4 oz/10 lb 23.50 per case Cooks 971505

217 MEAT:  VEAL PATTIES UNBREADED- 4OZ Mivila 4 oz/10 lb 28.50 per case MaidRite 971508

218 MEAT: CHICKEN LEG, BREADED COOKED PCASE JAMAC $4.20 10 lb. $42.00 Pierce 65050

219 PASTA:  RAVIOLI CHEESE 102 / 8LB CASE JAMAC $1.80 10 lb. $18.00 Fancy Lady

220 PASTA:  RAVIOLI MEAT  102 / 8LB CASE JAMAC $2.20 10 lb. $22.00 Fancy Lady 70580

221 PASTA:  RAVIOLI SEAFOOD  102 / 8LB CASE JAMAC $18.20 $109.20 Rana 500133

222 PASTA:  STUFFED SHELLS – 2.75 OZ  70/CASE JAMAC $2.13 96 2.75 oz $32.00 Fancy Lady FL993

223 PASTRAMI– WHOLE UNSLICED JAMAC $4.80 18 lb $86.40 Nations Best NB180

224 PIEROGI-CHEESE & POTATO JAMAC $6.40 5 lb. $32.00 Popkoff

225
PIZZA:  CHEESE FROZEN PIZZA 3” X 5” SQUARES 

50/CASE–3 OZ
Cardinal Foods 80 ct 1 $37.95 Nardones

226
PIZZA:  CHEESE FROZEN PIZZA 5” ROUND – 5 OZ 

EACH 60 / CASE
JAMAC $4.40 24 5 oz $33.10 Tony's 63532

227 POT PIES:  BEEF POT PIES 9.5 OZ 24 per CASE Karetas Foods LLC case 24 $23.70 Banquet 323000

228 POT PIES:  CHICKEN POT PIES 9.5 OZ 24 per CASE Karetas Foods LLC case 24 $23.70 Banquet 324001

229 POT PIES:  TURKEY POT PIES 9.5 OZ 24 per CASE Karetas Foods LLC case 24 $23.70 Banquet 322990

230 POTATO:  HASH BROWN POTATO – INDIVIDUAL JAMAC $1.02 6 3.5 lb $21.60 Lambs

231 POTATO:  HASH BROWN POTATO 21 lbs Mivila 6 5 lb 24.5 per case Cavendish
#04119---Small Chunky 

Diced

232 POTATO:  POTATO SKINS, FROZEN JAMAC $2.24 4 4.25 lb $38.08 McCain's

233 POTATO:  POTATO WEDGES (SKIN OFF) Mivila 6 5 lb 25.90 per case Cavendish #05225----Clear Coat

234 POTATO:  POTATO WEDGES (SKIN ON) 25 lbs JAMAC $0.93 6 5 lb $28.00 Lambs
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235
POTATO:  POTATO, FRENCH FRIED POTATO – 

CRINKLE CUT 30 LB
JAMAC $0.60 6 5 lb $18.20 Golden Foods

236
POTATO:  POTATO, FRENCH FRIED POTATO – 

CURLY
Mivila 6 5 lb 29.85 per case McCain 890133

237
POTATO:  POTATO, FRENCH FRIED POTATO – 

REGULAR
JAMAC $0.65 6 5 lb $19.60 Golden Foods 909

238
POTATO:  POTATO, FRENCH FRIED POTATO – 

SHOE STRING 30 LB
Mivila 6 4.5 lb 18.90 per case Spud Queen 890133

239
POTATO:  SCALLOPED POTATOES W/ CHEESE 4-

6LB TRYS
JAMAC $2.00 4 72 oz $36.00 Stouffers 1911

240 POTATO:  STEAK FRIED POTATO JAMAC $0.65 6 5 lb $19.60 Golden Foods 933

241 POTATO:  TATER TOTS Karetas Foods LLC case 6 $17.25 Packer 208418

242 POTATO:  TATER TOTS W / CHEESE JAMAC $3.20 106 1.5 oz $32.00 Splendid Cuisine 02060

243
PRE-COOKED MEALS:  EGGPLANT PARMESAN  4-

6LB TRYS
JAMAC $2.75 4 5 lb. $55.00 Fancy Lady HT206

244
PRE-COOKED MEALS:  LASAGNA, CHEESE 4-6LB 

TRYS
JAMAC $1.75 4 6 lb $42.00 Fancy Lady 70400

245
PRE-COOKED MEALS:  LASAGNA, MEAT 4-6LB 

TRYS
Mivila 4 96 oz 59.90 per case Stouffers 870731

246
PRE-COOKED MEALS:  LASAGNA, VEGETABLE 

LASAGNA  4-6LB TRYS
Karetas Foods LLC case 4 $43.00 Caesars 320386

247
PRE-COOKED MEALS:  MACARONI & BEEF / 

TOMATO SAUCE 4-6LB TRYS
Karetas Foods LLC case 4 $41.75 Stouffers 322040

248
PRE-COOKED MEALS:  MACARONI & CHEESE 4-

6LB TRYS
Mivila 4 76 oz 33.90 per case Stouffers 870736

249
PRE-COOKED MEALS:  MEATLOAF, SLICED W/ 

SAUCE 4-6LB TRYS
JAMAC $2.60 4 5 lb $52.00 Fancy Lady

250
PRE-COOKED MEALS:  POTATO SCALLOPED 

POTATOES 4-6LB TRYS
Mivila 4 72 oz 36.90 per case Stouffers #30486

251
PRE-COOKED MEALS:  SALISBURY W/ GRAVY 4-

6LB TRYS
JAMAC $2.40 4 5 lb $48.00 Fancy Lady 605-NJ

252
PRE-COOKED MEALS:  STUFFED CABBAGE / NO 

SAUCE 4-6LB TRYS
Mivila 48 4.83 oz 69.85 per case Award Cuisine 872140

253
PRE-COOKED MEALS:  STUFFED CABBAGE 

W/SAUCE 4-6LB TRYS
Mivila 4 92 oz 74.90 per case Stouffers 872148

254
PRE-COOKED MEALS:  STUFFED PEPPERS / NO 

SAUCE 4-6LB TRYS
Mivila 4 48 ct. 68.90 per case Award Cuisine #48515

255
PRE-COOKED MEALS:  STUFFED PEPPERS 4-6LB 

TRYS
Mivila 4 83 oz 59.90 per case Stouffers 872152

256
PRE-COOKED MEALS:  SWEDISH MEATBALLS W/ 

GRAVY 4-6LB TRYS
Mivila 4 62 oz 55.25 per case Stouffers 871911

257
SEAFOOD:  COD FISH – BREADED - 5 OZ 10 LB 

BOX
JAMAC $2.80 10 lb. $28.00 Fishery 29534

258 SEAFOOD:  CODFISH – RAW - 5 OZ 10 LB BOX Cardinal Foods $3.75 10 lb 1 $37.50 Packer

259
SEAFOOD:  FISH STICKS POLLOCK-BREADED FISH 

STICKS-1 OZ 10 LB BOX
Mivila 1 oz/10 lb 17.50 per case Channel 950519

260 SEAFOOD:  FLOUNDER, BREADED 10 LB BOX Mivila 1oz/10 lb 26.85 per case Channel #3250B3D7-----Pollock
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261
SEAFOOD:  FLOUNDER, LEMON INCRUSTED 

FLOUNDER –4 OZ  10 LB BOX
Mivila 2.98 per lb 4 oz/10 lb Channel #9---Pollock

262 SEAFOOD:  FLOUNDER-RAW 10 LB BOX Mivila 3.89 per lb 4-5 oz/10 lb Packer Label 950304

263 SEAFOOD:  POLLOCK- BREADED - 4 OZ 10 LB BOX Karetas Foods LLC case 40 $15.90 packer 141014

264 SEAFOOD:  POLLOCK-RAW – 4 OZ 10 LB BOX Mivila 1.89 per lb 4-6 oz/10 lb Packer Label 950309

265 SEAFOOD:  SEA LEGS, IMITATION 10 LB BOX Mivila 12 2.5 lb 36.00 per case Packer Label 950313

266 SEAFOOD:  TILAPIA FILET – 5 OZ  10 LB BOX Cardinal Foods $2.29 10 lb 1 $22.90 Packer

267
SEAFOOD:  WHITING-BREADED SQUARES – 4 OZ 

10 LB BOX
JAMAC $1.90 10 lb. $19.00 Channel

268 SEASONING:  GARLIC No Bid

269 SEASONING:  GARLIC-PEELED Karetas Foods LLC case 4 $80.00 Packer 10590

270 SEASONING:  PARSLEY No Bid

271 SEASONING:  SCALLIONS No Bid

272
SHAKES:  HIGH PROTEIN SHAKES – ASST 

FLAVORS  4 OZ 75 per CASE
No Bid

273 SOUR CREAM:  5 LB CONTAINER Mivila 6.95 per lb 4 5 lb C-O-L 191900

274 SOUR CREAM:  P/C 1 OZ 100 / CASE Mivila 100 1 oz cups 17.95 per case HD Hood 191904

275 VEGAN:  CHICKEN NUGGETS 10 LB BOX Karetas Foods LLC case 6 $22.25 MorningStar 470104

276 VEGAN:  CHICKEN PATTIES, BREADED 48/CASE Mivila 64 2.5 oz 41.90 per case Dr. Praeger #SCPT1N25

277
VEGAN:  CHICKEN PATTIES, VEGGIE/UNBREADED  

48/CASE
JAMAC $5.21 10 lb. $52.10 Meal Mart

278
VEGAN:  CHICKEN PATTY FROZEN BREADED 

VEGAN CHICKEN PATTY
Mivila 64 2.5 oz 41.90 per case Dr. Praeger #SCPTIN25

279 VEGAN:  CHICKEN STRIPS, VEGAN/FROZEN Mivila 285 .56 oz 39.75 per case Dr. Praeger #SCSPIN

280
VEGAN:  CHICKEN STRIPS-VEGGIE/BREADED 10 

LB BOX
Mivila 183 .87 oz 41.90 per case Dr. Praeger #SCTDIN

281
VEGAN:  CHILI, VEGAN  (Frozen)2.5 Lb Bag 10LB 

BOX
JAMAC 16 lb. $46.00 Campbells

282
VEGAN:  GRILLED STEAK, VEGGIE / 3.2 oz. 

Ea.48/CASE
No Bid

283 VEGAN:  HOT DOGS-VEGGIE 10 LB BOX No Bid

284
VEGAN:  MEATBALLS, FROZEN VEGAN 

MEATBALLS – 1 OZ
Mivila 1oz/10 lb 36.90 per case Dr. Praeger

878042----Vegetarian-

Gluten Free

285 VEGAN:  MEATBALLS, VEGGIE 10 LB BOX Mivila 1 oz/10 lb 36.45 per case Dr. Praeger
878042----Vegetarian-

Gluten Free

286
VEGAN:  VEGETABLE PATTIES, VEGAN (47 

PATTIES/ BOX) 10.5 LB BOX 
JAMAC $5.00 10 lb. $50.00 Dr. Praeger
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287 VEGAN:  VEGETARIAN PATTIES – 4 OZ JAMAC $2.99 8 11 oz $29.90 Gardein 400101

288
VEGETABES:  FROZEN MIXED VEGETABLES  

2.5LB BG-12 in CASE
JAMAC $0.72 12 2.5 lb $21.60 Packer

289 VEGETABLES:  ASPARAGUS JAMAC $1.80 6 2.5 lb $27.00 Packer

290 VEGETABLES:  BASIL JAMAC $7.80 5 lb. $39.00 Supherb

291
VEGETABLES:  BROCCOLI SPEARS 2LB BG-12/ 

CASE, FROZEN
JAMAC $0.77 12 2 lb $18.48 Packer

292 VEGETABLES:  BROCCOLI STALKS Gargiulo Produce Case 14 ct $26.50 Packer

293
VEGETABLES:  BRUSSEL SPROUTS 2.5LB BG-12/ 

CASE, FROZEN
Cardinal Foods $0.72 12 / 2 lb 24 lb $17.28 Packer

294 VEGETABLES:  CABBAGE - RED Gargiulo Produce Case 50 lb $28.00 Packer

295 VEGETABLES:  CABBAGE – WHITE Gargiulo Produce Case 50 lb $18.00 Packer

296 VEGETABLES:  CARROTS – BABY / 1 LB BAGS Gargiulo Produce Case 30 lb $32.00 Packer

297 VEGETABLES:  CARROTS – LARGE Gargiulo Produce Case 50 lb $24.50 Packer

298 VEGETABLES:  CELERY - (WHOLE) Gargiulo Produce Case 50 lb $24.50 Packer

299 VEGETABLES:  CELERY (HEARTS) 2 PER BG Gargiulo Produce Case 24 ct $24.50 Packer

300 VEGETABLES:  CILANTRO Gargiulo Produce Case Kilo $19.50 Packer

301 VEGETABLES:  CORN ON THE COB JAMAC 48 ct $16.00 Packer

302 VEGETABLES:  CUCUMBERS Gargiulo Produce Case 48 ct $24.50 Packer

303 VEGETABLES:  EGGPLANT Gargiulo Produce Case 16 ct $24.00 Packer

304 VEGETABLES:  ESCAROLE Gargiulo Produce Case 24 ct $26.00 Packer

305
VEGETABLES:  FROZEN ASPARAGUS 2.5LB BG-12/ 

CASE
Cardinal Foods $1.58 4 / 2.5 lb 15 lb $23.70 Packer

306
VEGETABLES:  FROZEN CARROTS SLICED 2.5LB 

BG-12/ CASE
Cardinal Foods $0.48 1 / 20 lb 20 lb $9.60 Packer

307
VEGETABLES:  FROZEN CAULIFLOWER 2.5LB BG-

12/ CASE
Cardinal Foods $0.72 1 / 20 lb 20 lb $14.40 Packer

308
VEGETABLES:  FROZEN CORN- WHOLE KERNEL 

2.5LB BG-12/ CASE
Cardinal Foods $0.66 1 / 20 lb 20 lb $13.20 Packer

309
VEGETABLES:  FROZEN GREEN SNAP BEANS 

2.5LB BG-12/ CASE
JAMAC $0.80 12 2 lb $19.20 Packer

310
VEGETABLES:  FROZEN ITALIAN GREEN BEANS  

2LB BG-12/ CASE
Cardinal Foods $0.72 12 / 2 lb 24 lb $17.28 Packer

311
VEGETABLES:  FROZEN LIMA BEANS 2.5LB BG-12/ 

CASE
Mivila 1.15 per lb 12 2.5 lb Idaho 910125

312 VEGETABLES:  FROZEN PEAS 2.5LB BG-12 in CASE Cardinal Foods $0.63 1 / 20 lb 20 lb $12.60 Packer
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313
VEGETABLES:  FROZEN WHOLE GREEN BEANS 

2.5LB BG-12/ CASE
Cardinal Foods $0.74 12 / 2 lb 24 lb $17.76 Packer

314
VEGETABLES:  FROZEN YELLOW SQUASH 2.5LB 

BG-12/ CASE
Cardinal Foods $0.74 12 / 3 lb 36 lb $26.64 Packer

315 VEGETABLES:  GREEN SQUASH Cardinal Foods $0.73 12 / 3 lb 36 lb $26.28 Packer

316
VEGETABLES:  LETTUCE,  SPRING MIX  1.5 LB 

BAG
Gargiulo Produce Case 3 lb $12.50 Packer

317 VEGETABLES:  LETTUCE, ICEBERG Gargiulo Produce Case 40 lb $28.00 Packer

318 VEGETABLES:  LETTUCE, ROMAINE Gargiulo Produce Case 35 lb $27.00 Packer

319
VEGETABLES:  LETTUCE, SHREDDED ICEBURG - 5 

LB BG
Gargiulo Produce Case 4 bag $19.00 Packer

320 VEGETABLES:  MUSHROOMS Gargiulo Produce Case 10 lb $18.00 Packer

321
VEGETABLES:  MUSHROOMS, WHOLE - PINT 

CONTAINERS
Gargiulo Produce Case 3 lb $9.50 Packer

322 VEGETABLES:  ONIONS – RED 25 LB BAG Gargiulo Produce Case 25 lb $14.50 Packer

323 VEGETABLES:  ONIONS – YELLOW 25 LB BAG Gargiulo Produce Case 50 lb $23.50 Packer

324 VEGETABLES:  PEPPERS-GREEN 15 LB BOX Gargiulo Produce Case 20 lb $19.50 Packer

325 VEGETABLES:  PEPPERS-YELLOW 15 LB BOX Gargiulo Produce Case 15 lb $27.50 Packer

326 VEGETABLES:  POTATO DICED WHITE - 5LB BAG Gargiulo Produce Case 20 lb $24.00 Packer

327 VEGETABLES:  POTATO-BAKING Gargiulo Produce Case 80 ct $26.00 Packer

328 VEGETABLES:  POTATO-IDAHO Gargiulo Produce Case 100 ct $24.00 Packer

329 VEGETABLES:  POTATO-RED Gargiulo Produce Case 50 lb $24.00 Packer

330 VEGETABLES:  POTATO-ROASTING Gargiulo Produce Case 50 lb $24.00 Packer

331 VEGETABLES:  POTATO-SWEET Gargiulo Produce Case 40 lb $21.00 Packer

332 VEGETABLES:  RADISHES Gargiulo Produce Case 10 lb $16.50 Packer

333 VEGETABLES:  RED PEPPERS (15 LB BOX) Gargiulo Produce Case 15 lb $27.50 Packer

334 VEGETABLES:  SNOW PEAS Gargiulo Produce Case 10 lb $36.00 Packer

335
VEGETABLES:  SNOW PEAS, FROZEN 2.5LB BG-12/ 

CASE
No Bid

336
VEGETABLES:  SPINACH, FROZEN 3LB BG-12 in 

CASE
Karetas Foods LLC case 12 $19.90 Packer 151126

337 VEGETABLES:  SPINACH-BABY Gargiulo Produce Case 4 lb $14.50 Packer

338 VEGETABLES:  STRING BEANS-WHOLE Gargiulo Produce Case 25 lb $36.00 Packer
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339 VEGETABLES:  TOMATOES  5X6 25 LB BOX Gargiulo Produce Case 25 lb $18.50 Packer

340 VEGETABLES:  TOMATOES SUN DRIED 5 LB BAG Gargiulo Produce Case 5 lb $18.50 Packer

341 VEGETABLES:  TOMATOES-BEEFSTEAK 6X6 Gargiulo Produce Case 25 lb $18.50 Packer

342
VEGETABLES:  TOMATOES-CHERRY PINT 

CONTAINTERS
Gargiulo Produce Case 12 ct $20.00 Packer

343
VEGETABLES:  TOMATOES-GRAPE PINT 

CONTAINTERS
Gargiulo Produce Case 12 ct $20.00 Packer

344 VEGETABLES:  TOMATOES-PLUM 25 LB BOX Gargiulo Produce Case 25 lb $20.50 Packer

345 VEGETABLES:  YELLOW SQUASH Gargiulo Produce Case 20 lb $28.00 Packer

346
VEGETABLES:  ZUCCHINI, FROZEN ZUCCHINI / 

SLICED 3LB BG-12/ CASE
Cardinal Foods $0.73 12 / 3 lb 36 lb $26.28 Packer

EXCEPTIONS:

Good Source Solutions:

* Kosher Meals must be ordered at a minmum of 26 cases (mix & match) at a time.

** Poultry items must be ordered at a minimum of 1 pallet (1,500 lbs.) at a time (mix & match)
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