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BID TABULATION SHEET
Title:  Equipment and Tool Rental
Opening Date:  Thursday, September 15, 2022 at 2:30 P.M.
Contract #:  CC-0028-22

Total Bids Received: 5

X X X
36427
3/27

Pave-Rite, Inc.
40 Radel Avenue

Bridgewater, NJ 08807
X X YESNOX YES



BIDDERS EXCEPTIONS 

Item No. Description (Including Manufacturer, Brand & Model Number) 

Services by PSI Process (Pumping Services, Inc.) 

Start-up, Troubleshooting and Maintenance 

-Non-emergency Service Rates (Scheduled Work) - Typically scheduled 3-5 Days in advance.

A. Normal Business-Hours (LABPE-C)

List: $223.00/Hr - Discounted Price: $211.85/Hr
B. Outside Business Hours (LABPEOT-C) List: $334.00/Hr - Discounted Price: $317.30/Hr

Installation of Electrical Panels, Wiring and Equipment. Non-Emergency 

scheduled service rates: 

A. Normal Business Hours (LAB19-C)

List $324.00/Hr. Discounted price $307.80.Hr
B. Outside\ Business Hours (LAB20-C)
List $390.00/Hr. Discount price $370.50/Hr.

A. Additional Helper (if Needed) (LAB 17-C)

List: $140.00/Hr. Discounted Price $133.00/Hr.
B. Outside\ Business Hours (LAB 18-C)

List: $210.00/Hr. Discount $199.50/Hr.
C. Emergency (LAB 18E-C)

List $210.00/hr. Discount $199.50
D. Sunday\Holiday
List:$281.00. Discount $266.95

A. Normal Business Hours Technician Day Rate (LABORDA Yl-C)

List:: $2671.00/day Discount: $2,537.45/Day

A. Normal Business hours Two person Crew Day rate (LABORDA Y2-C)
List: $4,335.00/day Discount $4,118.25/Day.

A. Normal Business hours Three person Crew Day Rate (LABORDAY3-C)
List: $6,455.00/day Discount $6,132.25/day

A. Normal business hours Additional helper Day rate (LABO RDA Yl H-C

List: $1,680.00/day Discount $1,596.00/day

Emergency Service Rates (Unscheduled Work) 

A. Emergency Unscheduled (LAB20E-C)

List $390.00/Hr. Discount price $370.50/Hr.
B. Sundays & Holidays (LAB20SH-C)

List $457.00/Hr. Discount 434.15/Hr.

Material and Subcontractors:: 
List: 25% Mark-up - Discounted price: 20% mark-up 

PSI Process



VENDOR NAME:

24 Hour Emergency Phone Number:

Option (A) 

Rental:  Equipment & Tools /                                                                          

No Operator:

Discount 

Percentage:            

DAY Rental

Discount 

Percentage: 

WEEK Rental

Discount 

Percentage: 

MONTH Rental

Discount 

Percentage:            

DAY Rental

Discount 

Percentage: 

WEEK Rental

Discount 

Percentage: 

MONTH Rental

Discount 

Percentage:            

DAY Rental

Discount 

Percentage: 

WEEK Rental

Discount 

Percentage: 

MONTH Rental

Discount 

Percentage:            

DAY Rental

Discount 

Percentage: 

WEEK Rental

Discount 

Percentage: 

MONTH Rental

Discount 

Percentage:            

DAY Rental

Discount 

Percentage: 

WEEK Rental

Discount 

Percentage: 

MONTH Rental

Percentage Discount Offered No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% 10% 15% 5% 5% 5% 8% 10% 15% 10% 10% 10%

Option (B)

Rental:  Equipment & Tools /                                                                                                                    

Requiring Operator:
DAY Rental WEEK Rental MONTH Rental DAY Rental WEEK Rental MONTH Rental DAY Rental WEEK Rental MONTH Rental DAY Rental WEEK Rental MONTH Rental DAY Rental WEEK Rental MONTH Rental

Percentage Discount Offered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 
Current Price/ Equipment & Tool List 

Provided?

Open-End Contract #CC-0028-22

See Attached

Equipment and Tool Rental

Jet Vac Equipment

195 Green Pond Road

Rockaway, NJ 07866

862-686-9029

Yes

Pave-Rite, Inc.

40 Radel Avenue

Bridgewater, NJ 08807

732-271-0110

Pumping Services

201 Lincoln Boulevard

Middlesex, NJ 08846

732-469-4540

Her Rentals Inc.

27500 Riverview Center Blvd, Bldg 7

Bonita Springs, FL 34134

201-681-5719

Sun-Belt Rentals

2341 Deerfield Drive

Fort Mill, SC 29715

1-800-667-9328

Yes Yes Yes Yes
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