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BID TABULATION SHEET
Title:   Mosquito Insecticides and Herbicides

Opening Date: July 31, 2024 at 2:00 P.M. 

Contract #:  CC-0046-24

YES

Exceptions for ADAPCO:  Line #28 for Merus 3.0; 

bidding equivalent as in 5% pyrethrin. Evergreen ULV 5-25 

ground use comes in a 5 gl pail. Evergreen ULV Air use comes in 

a 5 gl pail. 

YES

Total Bids Received: 2

X X X
37367

8/26

Adapco Inc.

550 Aero Lane

Sanford, FL 32771

YESX X X

YESX X X NO YES

Heritage Landscape Supply Group, 

Inc.

7440 State Highway 121

McKinney, TX 75070

X X X





Item 
Brand or 

Equivalent
Container Description Brand Bidding Container Size Unit Price Brand Bidding Container Size Unit Price

1% Prallethrin

5% Sumithrin

5% Piperonyl Butoxide

2 BVA2 Larvacide
55 Gallon 

Drum
98.7% Petroleum Distillate Mosquito Larvacide BVA2 55 gl drum $22.75/gl

3 Vectobac 12AS
2.5 Gallon 

Container
Bacillus Thuringiensis H-14 Flowable 1200 ITU/MG 1.2% Vectobac 12as 2 x 2.5 gl case $41.45/gl Vectobac 12as 2.5 gal $130.85 

4 Vectobac 12AS
30 Gallon 

Drum
Bacillus Thuringiensis H-14 Flowable 1200 ITU/MG 1.2% Vectobac 12as 30 gl drum $41.25/gl

5 Vectobac 12AS
264 Gallon Mini 

Tote
Bacillus Thuringiensis H-14 Flowable 1200 ITU/MG 1.2% Vectobac 12as 264 gl tote $40.64/gl

6 Vectolex FS 40 Pound Bag Bacillus Sphaericus Serotype H5A5B CG Vectolex FG 40 lb bag $6.45/lb

7 Bonide
55 Gallon 

Drum
Larvacide/Pupacide Mineral Oil 98%

8 BVA 13
1 Gallon 

Container
Diluent Oil BVA 13 or Calpar

5 gl pail or 55 gl 

drum 
$22.48/gl

9 Fyfanon 5 Gallon Pail Malathion 96.5% ULV Premium Grade Fyfanon ULV 5 gl pail $96.73/gl

10 Fyfanon
55 Gallon 

Drum

Malathion 96.5% ULV Premium Grade (Returnable Steel 

or Plastic, No Rinsing)
Fyfanon ULV 55 gl drum $92.09/gl

11 Vectobac G 40 Pound Bag
Bacillus Thuringiensis H-14 Granules 5/8 Mesh 200 

ITU/MG 0.2%

Vectobac G Strain AM65-

52 5/8 Mesh 
40 lb bag $1.85/lb Vectobac G 40 lb $107.83 

12 Aquabac 200G 40 Pound Bag
Bacillus Thuringiensis H-14 Granules 5/8 Mesh 200 

ITU/MG 0.2%

13 Vectobac G 40 Pound Bag
Bacillus Thuringiensis H-14 Granules 10/14 Mesh 200 

ITU/MG 0.2%

Vectobac GS Strain 

AM65-52 10/14 Mesh 
40 lb bag $1.85/lb Vectobac G 40 lb $107.83 

14 Aquabac 200G 40 Pound Bag
Bacillus Thuringiensis H-14 Granules 10/14 Mesh 200 

ITU/MG 0.2%

15 Aquabac XT 5 Gallon Pail Bacillus Thuringiensis H-14 Flowable 1200 ITU/MG 1.2%

16 Altosid SR-20 5 Gallon Pail Methoprene Liquid Larvacide Concentrate 20%

17 Altosid
1 Gallon 

Container
Methoprene Liquid Larvacide Concentrate 5%

18
Altosid 30- Day 

Briquets
Case of 400 Methoprene

Altosid 30-Day 

Briquets
4x100 Case $169.35 

19
Altosid XR 

Briquets
Case of 220 Methoprene

20 Altosid Pellets 44 Pound Case 4% Methoprene Pellets

Heritage Landscape Supply Group, Inc.

7440 State Highway 121

McKinney, TX 75070

ADAPCO, LLC

100 Colonial Center Parkway, Suite 170

Lake Mary, FL 32746

Mosquito Insecticides and Herbicides

Open End Contract #CC-0046-24

The container size you bid will be considered one unit.

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Vendor:

1 Duet HD
55 Gallon 

Drum

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 



21 Teknar G 40 Pound Bag
Bacillus Thuringiensis H-14 Granules 5/8 Mesh 200 

ITU/MG 0.2%

22 Teknar CG 40 Pound Bag
Bacillus Thuringiensis H-14 Granules 10/14 Mesh 200 

ITU/MG 0.2%

23 Teknar HP-D
2.5 Gallon 

Container
Bacillus Thuringiensis H-14 Flowable 1200 ITU/MG 1.2%

24 H-14 Briquets Case of 100 Bacillus Thuringiensis H-14 7000 ITU/MG 10% Bactimos

25 Altosid XRG 40 Pound Bag Methoprene Granules 1.5% Extended Release

40 Pound

Bag

27 Natular G30 40 Pound Bag Spinosad .5%

2.5 Gallon

Container

2.5 Gallon Fenpropathrin 4%

Container Abamectin 1.5 %

30 Rodeo Herbicide
2.5 Gallon 

Container
Glyphosate 53.8% Roundup Custom 2.5 gal $57.39 

31 Polaris
2.5 Gallon 

Container
Isopropyl amine salt of Imazapyr 27.7% Ecomazapyr 2SL 2.5 gal $141.43 

32
Accord XRT 

Herbicide

2.5 Gallon 

Container
Glyphosate 53.8% Roundup Custom 2.5 gal $57.39 

4 Pound 

1 Oz Container

34 Clean Cut
2.5 Gallon 

Container
Alphatic Based Petroleum Oil

35 41-A
32 Oz 

Container
Polycrylamide Polimer Drift Retardant

36 Aquachem 90
2.5 Gallon 

Container
Alkyl Phenol Ethoxylate and Alcohol Ethoxylate 90% Windsurf Pro 2.5 gal $27.85 

37
Esplanade 

200SC

2.5 Gallon 

Container
Indaziflam 19.05% Esplanade 200SC 2.5 gal $3,772.80 

38
Altosid SR-5 

Liquid Larvicide

1 Gallon 

Container
(S)-Methoprene 5%

39 Viewpoint 5 Lb. Container

Imazapyr 31.6%

Aminocyclopyrachlor 22.8%

Metsulfuron methyl 7.3%

Exceptions for ADAPCO:    Line #28 for Merus 3.0; bidding equivalent as in 5% pyrethrin. Evergreen ULV 5-25 ground use comes in a 5 gl pail. Evergreen ULV Air use comes in a 5 gl pail. 

YES
YESWilling to provide to Cooperative  Members YES

Oust Xtra 4 lb $129.13 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Willing to accept an award of contract as a secondary provider YES

26 Natular G Spinosad .5%

28 Merus 3.0 Pyrethrins 5%

29 ReMoA Tri

$245.25/gl

$285.24/gl

$310.00/gl 

33 Oust Xtra
Sulfometuron Methyl 56.25% and Metsulfuron Methyl 

%15

Evergreen ULV 5-25 Ground

Evergreen ULV 5-25 Air 
5 gl pails

Remoa Tri 2 x 2.5 gl case

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
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